
VOLVO EC350EL 310558 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP0007509
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY8750 PHILIPS HWYJACKSONVILLE, FLUS  32256Contact: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNTcatherine.anastasio@wearcheck.comT: F: (904)737-1260
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. We advise thatyou check all areas where dirt canenter the system. We recommendthat you drain the oil from thecomponent if this has not alreadybeen done. We advise that youinspect for the source(s) of wear. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. There is a moderateconcentration of water present in theoil. Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. The oil isno longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0092Unique No: 10606415Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 17 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 05926468 (Generated: 08/18/2023 16:16:54) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0007509 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 388 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.459 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 1426 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 69 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 19 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4249 --- --- ---Copper ppm 8 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 132 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 62 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 6 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 6 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 15 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 37 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2649 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 104 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 5 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 645 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 72 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 05926468 (Generated: 08/18/2023 16:16:57) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350EL 310558\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP0007509] 11 Aug 2023 @ .0 hrs

