
[[X47389]] VOLVO A25G 752644 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP415861
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: X47389

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Lake CharlesPO BOX 16955LAKE CHARLES, LAUS  70616Contact: SAMANTHA SOILEAUssoileau@scottcompanies.comT: (337)433-9811F: (318)433-6623
Diagnosis
This is a baseline read-out on thesubmitted sample. We recommendyou service the filters on thiscomponent.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thesystem. There is a moderate amountof visible silt present in the sample.The water content is negligible. Thecondition of the fuel is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO6244Unique No: 10606454Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 18 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO6244 [WUSCAR] 05926507 (Generated: 01/02/2024 10:32:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SAMANTHA SOILEAU - VOLVO6244

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP415861 VCP407873 --- ---Sample Date 10 Aug 2023 16 May 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1428 770 --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 68 --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.56 2.53 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.004 0.004 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 0 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silicon ppm 0 <1 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6244 [WUSCAR] 05926507 (Generated: 01/02/2024 10:32:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SAMANTHA SOILEAU - VOLVO6244
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 752644\Diesel Fuel [VCP415861] 10 Aug 2023 @ 1428.0 hrs

