
VOLVO EC200EL 314937 - DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF)

Sample No: VCP412374
Oil Type: DEF (Diesel Exaust Fluid)
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5151 DR MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVDFORT MYERS, FLUS  33905Contact: DEWAYNE BEARDDBeard@flaglerce.comT: (239)481-8554F: (239)481-3302
Diagnosis
Fluid meets ISO 22241-2requirements and is suitable for use.Appearance is acceptable. There is noindication of any contamination inthe diesel exhaust fluid (def). Ureacontent is normal.

Depot: VOLVO0090Unique No: 10606458Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 22 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05926511 (Generated: 08/22/2023 21:34:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DEWAYNE BEARD - VOLVO0090

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412374 --- --- ---Sample Date 08 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONHydrocarbon scalar NONE --- --- ---
 DEF CONDITION

Urea Content % 32.4 --- --- ---Density @ 20°C g/cm3 1.0880 --- --- ---Refracting Index 1.3822 --- --- ---Appearance scalar Clear & Bright --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Sample Color & Clarity

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05926511 (Generated: 08/22/2023 21:34:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DEWAYNE BEARD - VOLVO0090
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC200EL 314937\Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) [VCP412374] 08 Aug 2023 @ .0 hrs

