
VOLVO SD115 236019 - GEARBOX

Sample No: VCP412276
Oil Type: MOBIL SH 600
Job No:

WLW CONSTRUCTIONPO BOX 377MT DORA, FLUS  32756-0377Contact: ELAINE STULTZelaine@wlwconstruction.comT: (352)383-7305F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. NOTE:one of two samples received withsame ID and sampling date.Gearwear is indicated. Bearing and/orbushing wear is indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: WLWMOUUnique No: 10608430Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 21 Aug 2023
Report Id: WLWMOU [WUSCAR] 05928483 (Generated: 08/21/2023 14:59:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ELAINE STULTZ - WLWMOU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412276 VCP422010 VCP385166 ---Sample Date 11 Aug 2023 11 Aug 2023 24 Oct 2022 ---Machine Hours 5001 5001 4470 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 220 200 202 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 6 41 33 ---Sodium ppm 4 <1 0 ---Potassium ppm 0 0 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 353 95 72 ---Copper ppm 137 0 <1 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm 1 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 0 0 1 ---Chromium ppm 4 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 <1 ---Nickel ppm <1 0 0 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 4 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 54 39 35 ---Magnesium ppm 3 6 5 ---Zinc ppm 128 304 307 ---Phosphorus ppm 776 438 438 ---Barium ppm 0 0 2 ---Boron ppm 29 0 4 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WLWMOU [WUSCAR] 05928483 (Generated: 08/21/2023 14:59:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ELAINE STULTZ - WLWMOU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO SD115 236019\Gearbox [VCP412276] 11 Aug 2023 @ 5001.0 hrs

