
[ASCENDUM MACHINERY [58879]] VOLVO L70H L-2 (S/N 622561) - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP420941
Oil Type: VOLVO VDS-4.5 Premium Motor Oil 15W40
Job No: 58879

CAROLINA EXCAVATING1036 BRANCHVIEW DR, SUITE 106CONCORD, NCUS  28025Contact: KEVIN LADGERWOODkevin@carlinaexcavation.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The wear metal levels donot reflect the reported failure. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: CARCONVCUnique No: 10609107Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 22 Aug 2023
Report Id: CARCONVC [WUSCAR] 05929160 (Generated: 09/12/2023 07:40:38) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP420941 ASC0000231 VCP0006382 VCP0002838Sample Date 18 Aug 2023 21 Jun 2023 29 Mar 2023 02 Jan 2023Machine Hours 7202 7001 6571 6002Oil Hours 0 430 569 448Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.4 12.9 13.9 13.4Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.4 10.2 9.0 9.8Oxidation (PA) % 69 74 56 67
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0.3 0.3 0.2Nitration (PA) % 47 55 57 58Sulfation (PA) % 56 59 50 54Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 12 4 5 4Sodium ppm 2 1 <1 <1Potassium ppm 3 <1 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 8 10 10Copper ppm <1 0 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 3 4 4Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 29 42 57 55Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1883 1611 1173 1434Magnesium ppm 345 597 846 658Zinc ppm 1133 1183 1084 1151Phosphorus ppm 955 953 966 964Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 104 39 7 94

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CARCONVC [WUSCAR] 05929160 (Generated: 09/12/2023 07:40:42) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H L-2 (S/N 622561)\Diesel Engine [VCP420941] 18 Aug 2023 @ 7202.0 hrs

