
[[CENTRAL SITE]] VOLVO E350 310458 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP417065
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: CENTRAL SITE

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. Light fueldilution occurring. The oil viscosity islower than normal. Additive levelsindicate the addition of a differentbrand, or type of oil. The BN level islow. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10609118Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 23 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05929171 (Generated: 08/23/2023 13:57:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP417065 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 6575 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 8.8 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 3.7 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 75 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 38 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 67 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 3.4 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 --- --- ---Copper ppm 5 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 18 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 629 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 184 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 643 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 547 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 10 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05929171 (Generated: 08/23/2023 13:57:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO E350 310458\Diesel Engine [VCP417065] 20 Aug 2023 @ 6575.0 hrs

