
VOLVO A30G 752302 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP418273
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No:

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: PM ServicesPMServices@ripaconstruction.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Confirm the source of the lubricantbeing utilized for top-up/fill.  It is alsopossible that this sample was takenfrom a different machine, or possiblymis-identified. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.The amount and size of particulatespresent in the system are acceptable.The oil viscosity is lower than normal.Additive levels indicate the additionof a different brand, or type of oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10609478Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 22 Aug 2023
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05929531 (Generated: 08/22/2023 16:50:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP418273 VCP420266 VCP364307 VCP350264Sample Date 25 Jul 2023 15 Apr 2023 30 Aug 2022 17 Feb 2022Machine Hours 7446 3244 2193 983Oil Hours 0 3244 2193 1500Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.7 46.6 45.1 42.5Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.90 0.59 0.40 0.55
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 33746 5226 8310 ---Particles >6µm 1904 1209 1290 ---Particles >14µm 100 69 56 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 22/18/14 20/17/13 20/17/13 ---Silicon ppm 6 3 2 3Sodium ppm 5 2 2 0Potassium ppm 1 <1 0 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 26 8 5 3Copper ppm 12 5 5 30Lead ppm 0 3 3 <1Tin ppm 3 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 16 0 <1 0Chromium ppm 0 0 0 0Molybdenum ppm 0 5 0 <1Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 1 0 <1 0Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 72 150 51 74Magnesium ppm 1 79 <1 2Zinc ppm 0 537 424 480Phosphorus ppm 193 415 320 366Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 94 0 0 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05929531 (Generated: 08/22/2023 16:50:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 752302\Hydraulic System [VCP418273] 25 Jul 2023 @ 7446.0 hrs

