
[[W02007426]] VOLVO EC350EL 310389 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP416111
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILUBE HD 85W140
Job No: W02007426

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO INC8450 QUARRY ROADMANASSAS, VAUS  20110Contact: MIKE MAYHUGHMMAYHUGH@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: (703)393-7344F: (703)393-7844
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0002Unique No: 10615317Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 22 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 05930046 (Generated: 08/22/2023 17:31:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416111 VCP376464 VCP326993 VCP279680Sample Date 04 Aug 2023 26 Aug 2022 10 Feb 2022 21 Jul 2021Machine Hours 8933 7996 7032 6146Oil Hours 1000 1000 1000 1000Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 250 165 163 169
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 1 5 3 6Sodium ppm <1 0 0 <1Potassium ppm <1 <1 1 10
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 44 44 84Copper ppm 4 2 1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 <1 0Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 0 1 <1 <1Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 11 16 17 16Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 196 554 596 480Magnesium ppm 82 147 149 134Zinc ppm 201 339 339 250Phosphorus ppm 550 905 974 902Barium ppm 0 <1 0 0Boron ppm 83 162 159 174

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 05930046 (Generated: 08/22/2023 17:31:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350EL 310389\Swing Drive [VCP416111] 04 Aug 2023 @ 8933.0 hrs

