
[[4143HS MACMOL]] VOLVO A40D 12682 - BRAKE COOLING SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP421981
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 4143HS MACMOL

HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT & SUPPLY CO MAINPO BOX 1957HARRISBURG, PAUS  17105Contact: CHAD HERRON
T: 7(175)643-3031F: (717)564-3568
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0025Unique No: 10615321Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 23 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0025 [WUSCAR] 05930050 (Generated: 09/11/2023 07:42:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHAD HERRON - VOLVO0025

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP421981 VC309247 --- ---Sample Date 11 Aug 2023 18 Sep 2008 --- ---Machine Hours 14321 3034 --- ---Oil Hours 0 624 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 46.1 56.82 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 9 23 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 5 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 28 --- ---Copper ppm 19 47 --- ---Lead ppm 0 1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 2 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm <1 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3076 3023 --- ---Magnesium ppm 30 23 --- ---Zinc ppm 1416 1282 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1133 976 --- ---Barium ppm 0 2 --- ---Boron ppm 48 91 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0025 [WUSCAR] 05930050 (Generated: 09/11/2023 07:42:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHAD HERRON - VOLVO0025
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40D 12682\Brake Cooling System [VCP421981] 11 Aug 2023 @ 14321.0 hrs

