
[[13078 IAA]] VOLVO L90G 623078 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP409368
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 13078 IAA

McClung-Logan Virginia LLC- RICHMOND1345 MOUNTAIN ROADGLEN ALLEN, VAUS  23060Contact: KYLE RATLIFFEKRATLIFFE@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: F: (804)266-1611
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8882Unique No: 10615789Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 22 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05930518 (Generated: 08/22/2023 19:04:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP409368 VCP194152 VCP182747 ---Sample Date 16 Aug 2023 08 Jun 2017 12 May 2016 ---Machine Hours 12335 3991 1943 ---Oil Hours 4000 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.7 38.79 43.34 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 17 12 48 ---Sodium ppm 10 2 4 ---Potassium ppm 1 <1 6 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 23 71 185 ---Copper ppm 1 2 7 ---Lead ppm 0 0 <1 ---Tin ppm <1 3 0 ---Aluminum ppm 1 <1 10 ---Chromium ppm <1 2 4 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 3 ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 1 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 2 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 3 8 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4223 2698 3862 ---Magnesium ppm 20 9 12 ---Zinc ppm 1688 1155 1545 ---Phosphorus ppm 1338 900 1235 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 141 78 104 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05930518 (Generated: 08/22/2023 19:04:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90G 623078\Front Axle [VCP409368] 16 Aug 2023 @ 12335.0 hrs

