
VOLVO A40G 352441 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP412291
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5151 DR MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVDFORT MYERS, FLUS  33905Contact: TODD LARKtlark@altaequipfl.comT: F: (239)481-3302
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor. No other corrective action isrecommended at this time.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Light fuel dilution occurring. Noother contaminants were detected inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO0090Unique No: 10615925Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 23 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05930654 (Generated: 08/23/2023 11:28:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412291 VCP411084 VCP331532 VCP344715Sample Date 16 Aug 2023 05 Jun 2023 13 Jan 2022 20 Oct 2021Machine Hours 6804 6447 3961 3406Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.9 12.2 12.6 12.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.1 10.4 11.2 ---Oxidation (PA) % 76 76 86 79
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.3 0.2Nitration (PA) % 53 51 65 60Sulfation (PA) % 58 59 65 61Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 1.7 1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 5 5 5Sodium ppm 2 <1 2 2Potassium ppm 0 1 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 4 4 4Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 <1 1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm <1 0 1 1Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 69 48 46 37Nickel ppm <1 <1 2 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1711 1613 1694 1675Magnesium ppm 532 493 504 434Zinc ppm 1085 1077 1150 1061Phosphorus ppm 908 902 937 884Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 59 54 44 37

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05930654 (Generated: 08/23/2023 11:28:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352441\Diesel Engine [VCP412291] 16 Aug 2023 @ 6804.0 hrs

