
[[SPM593279]] SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.3070 - RIGHT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP411397
Oil Type: SHELL 220
Job No: SPM593279

BELSON STEEL1685 N STATE RTE 50BOURBONNAIS, ILUS  60914Contact: M. POZANmpozan@belsonsteel.comT: (815)932-7416F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. Resample at the next serviceinterval to monitor.All componentwear rates are normal. There is amoderate concentration of waterpresent in the oil. The condition ofthe oil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: BELBOUUnique No: 10616415Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 24 Aug 2023
Report Id: BELBOU [WUSCAR] 05931144 (Generated: 08/24/2023 10:27:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: M. POZAN - BELBOU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP411397 VCP402107 --- ---Sample Date 11 Aug 2023 20 Mar 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 2080 1076 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 211 211 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.424 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 6 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 1 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 379 293 --- ---Copper ppm 48 44 --- ---Lead ppm <1 0 --- ---Tin ppm 5 4 --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 2 2 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 0 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 3 3 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 7 7 --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 76 41 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 381 442 --- ---Barium ppm 0 1 --- ---Boron ppm 11 15 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: BELBOU [WUSCAR] 05931144 (Generated: 08/24/2023 10:27:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: M. POZAN - BELBOU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.3070\Right Swing Drive [VCP411397] 11 Aug 2023 @ 2080.0 hrs

