
[[SPM593757 WM HODGKIN]] VOLVO L90H 624824 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP399659
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: SPM593757 WM HODGKIN

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: DAVE ENGDAVE.ENG@ALTG.COMT: (312)350-2560F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 10616473Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 05931202 (Generated: 08/23/2023 19:42:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP399659 VCP382909 VCP382900 VCP399974Sample Date 08 Aug 2023 29 Jun 2023 08 Jun 2023 07 Jun 2023Machine Hours 9594 9453 9431 9431Oil Hours 0 22 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd N/A Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.1 28.0 29.9 31.5
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 31 13 5 7Sodium ppm 8 7 6 5Potassium ppm 20 14 <1 3
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 21 9 52 56Copper ppm 3 3 191 169Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm <1 0 7 9Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 3 3Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 5 4 1 1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 77 82 183 172Magnesium ppm <1 <1 40 38Zinc ppm 9 2 84 77Phosphorus ppm 173 185 268 243Barium ppm 0 <1 0 0Boron ppm 69 84 66 66

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 05931202 (Generated: 08/23/2023 19:42:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 624824\Transmission (Auto) [VCP399659] 08 Aug 2023 @ 9594.0 hrs

