
[[SWO065035 SUNBELT]] DOOSAN C185 443269UBADG87 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP389343
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: SWO065035 SUNBELT

COWIN EQUIPMENT - ATLANTA5710 RIVERVIEW RDMABLETON, GAUS  30126Contact: MIKE ANDREWSmandrews@cowin.comT: (404)690-7210F: 
Diagnosis
This is a baseline read-out on thesubmitted sample. No correctiveaction is recommended at thistime.All metal levels are normalindicating no corrosion in the system.The water content is negligible. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the fuel. The condition of the fuelis acceptable for the time in service.

Depot: COWMABUnique No: 10616541Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 24 Aug 2023
Report Id: COWMAB [WUSCAR] 05931270 (Generated: 08/24/2023 13:59:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE ANDREWS - COWMAB

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP389343 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1258 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.43 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.006 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COWMAB [WUSCAR] 05931270 (Generated: 08/24/2023 13:59:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE ANDREWS - COWMAB
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	DOOSAN DOOSAN C185 443269UBADG87\Diesel Fuel [VCP389343] 15 Aug 2023 @ 1258.0 hrs

