
VOLVO L70G L70G 2307 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP0008026
Oil Type: HYBRID (HOAT) COOLANT
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY8750 PHILIPS HWYJACKSONVILLE, FLUS  32256Contact: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNTcatherine.anastasio@wearcheck.comT: F: (904)737-1260
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Glycoland nitrite levels are acceptable. ThepH level of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VOLVO0092Unique No: 10616552Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 24 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 05931281 (Generated: 08/24/2023 20:05:06) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0008026 --- --- ---Sample Date 18 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.85 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 260 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 50.3 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -35 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 05931281 (Generated: 08/24/2023 20:05:09) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70G L70G 2307\Coolant [VCP0008026] 18 Aug 2023 @ .0 hrs

