
[[9483 WASTE MGMT]] VOLVO L70G 614434 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP413675
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 9483 WASTE MGMT

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO INC MAIN4601 WASHINGTON BOULEVARDBALTIMORE, MDUS  21227Contact: MARK CIULLAmciulla@mcclung-logan.comT: (410)242-6500F: (410)242-7835
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO0150Unique No: 10616593Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 23 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 05931322 (Generated: 08/23/2023 13:32:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK CIULLA - VOLVO0150

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413675 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 22133 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.9 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.4 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 59 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 59 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 52 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 14 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 23 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 65 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1048 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1177 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1335 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1073 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 79 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 05931322 (Generated: 08/23/2023 13:32:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK CIULLA - VOLVO0150
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70G 614434\Diesel Engine [VCP413675] 16 Aug 2023 @ 22133.0 hrs

