
[[594282 DIPRO]] KUBOTA SVL90-2 11834 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP411901
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 594282 DIPRO

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PAUL CONZpaul.conz@altg.comT: F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor this condition.We were unable to perform a particlecount due to a high concentration ofparticles present in this sample.Theiron level is severe. Component wearmetal level(s) high for break in. Thereis a moderate amount of visible siltpresent in the sample. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 10616757Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 24 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 05931486 (Generated: 09/05/2023 13:35:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL CONZ - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP411901 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1956 --- --- ---Oil Hours 1956 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 46.2 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.51 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 14 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 365 --- --- ---Copper ppm 32 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1653 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 32 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 737 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 657 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 5 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 05931486 (Generated: 09/05/2023 13:35:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL CONZ - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KUBOTA KUBOTA SVL90-2 11834\Hydraulic System [VCP411901] 15 Aug 2023 @ 1956.0 hrs

