
[[9483 WASTE MGMT]] VOLVO L70G 614434 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP413674
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL WB102
Job No: 9483 WASTE MGMT

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO INC MAIN4601 WASHINGTON BOULEVARDBALTIMORE, MDUS  21227Contact: MARK CIULLAmciulla@mcclung-logan.comT: (410)242-6500F: (410)242-7835
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We advise thatyou inspect for the source(s) of wear.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. Moderate concentration ofvisible dirt/debris present in the oil.The oil is no longer serviceable as aresult of the abnormal and/or severewear.

Depot: VOLVO0150Unique No: 10617029Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 24 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 05931758 (Generated: 08/24/2023 12:58:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK CIULLA - VOLVO0150

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413674 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 22133 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 51.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 15 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1232 --- --- ---Copper ppm 10 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 6 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 10 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 12 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 10 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3494 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1415 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1190 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 131 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 05931758 (Generated: 08/24/2023 12:58:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK CIULLA - VOLVO0150
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70G 614434\Rear Axle [VCP413674] 16 Aug 2023 @ 22133.0 hrs

