
[[W07013270]] VOLVO A45G 342200 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP418315
Oil Type: MOBIL ATF
Job No: W07013270

McClung-Logan Virginia LLC- RICHMOND1345 MOUNTAIN ROADGLEN ALLEN, VAUS  23060Contact: KYLE RATLIFFEKRATLIFFE@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: F: (804)266-1611
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in thefluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8882Unique No: 10617058Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 24 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05931787 (Generated: 08/24/2023 13:08:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP418315 VCP401332 VCP318969 VCP225287Sample Date 17 Aug 2023 12 Jan 2023 16 Jul 2021 06 Feb 2019Machine Hours 9068 8032 5985 1953Oil Hours 1000 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd N/A Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.2 21.7 26.5 26.6
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 8 6 7 14Sodium ppm <1 <1 5 6Potassium ppm 2 2 1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 23 43 41 47Copper ppm 55 119 100 24Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 6 12 10 2Aluminum ppm 14 21 13 19Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm 9 17 16 2Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 2 2 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 103 143 109 80Magnesium ppm 2 1 <1 2Zinc ppm 13 32 0 6Phosphorus ppm 206 198 158 143Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1Boron ppm 107 86 66 57

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05931787 (Generated: 08/24/2023 13:09:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 342200\Transmission (Auto) [VCP418315] 17 Aug 2023 @ 9068.0 hrs

