
VOLVO SD115B 236555 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP415943
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No:

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: PM ServicesPMServices@ripaconstruction.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. Oil and filter changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. Resample at the next serviceinterval to monitor.All componentwear rates are normal. There is amoderate amount of fuel present inthe oil. Fuel is present in the oil and islowering the viscosity. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10617110Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 25 Aug 2023
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05931839 (Generated: 08/25/2023 09:52:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP415943 VCP386101 VCP359056 VCP343533Sample Date 18 Aug 2023 13 Sep 2022 02 May 2022 30 Nov 2021Machine Hours 5688 5481 5221 4650Oil Hours 0 500 500 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.7 11.7 13.0 12.7Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.2 11.0 8.0 9.5Oxidation (PA) % 77 87 78 84
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 0.7 1 0.5Nitration (PA) % 61 87 106 95Sulfation (PA) % 60 67 64 60Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 5.8 5.9 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 6 7 7 9Sodium ppm 3 2 3 3Potassium ppm 0 4 6 4
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 31 21 23 18Copper ppm <1 1 2 3Lead ppm 0 <1 2 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 1 2Aluminum ppm 8 2 3 5Chromium ppm <1 1 2 2Molybdenum ppm 40 43 63 52Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1525 1603 1929 1572Magnesium ppm 490 447 409 728Zinc ppm 1024 1057 1159 1240Phosphorus ppm 872 866 956 1031Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 42 22 15 11

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05931839 (Generated: 08/25/2023 09:52:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO SD115B 236555\Diesel Engine [VCP415943] 18 Aug 2023 @ 5688.0 hrs

