
[[594651]] VOLVO EW180 320056 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP412533
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 594651

HUBBARD CONSTRUCTION303 WEST LANDSTREET ROADORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: RAY BIRKOray.birko@hubbard.comT: (407)855-3535F: (407)857-1282
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: HUBORLUnique No: 10617210Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 24 Aug 2023
Report Id: HUBORL [WUSCAR] 05931939 (Generated: 08/24/2023 16:54:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RAY BIRKO - HUBORL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412533 VCP381503 VCP372712 VCP310143Sample Date 17 Aug 2023 31 Oct 2022 27 Jun 2022 26 Jun 2021Machine Hours 3505 3440 6528 2404Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.3 13.3 13.3 13.4Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.4 11.7 10.8 ---Oxidation (PA) % 75 88 85 84
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 0.2 0.2 0.1Nitration (PA) % 43 66 65 52Sulfation (PA) % 58 66 63 65Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 8 6 5 5Sodium ppm 3 4 4 2Potassium ppm 2 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 30 17 18 3Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 3 3 4 0Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 43 45 41 37Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1690 1775 1697 1517Magnesium ppm 523 531 507 458Zinc ppm 1111 1092 1078 986Phosphorus ppm 946 915 890 869Barium ppm 0 <1 0 0Boron ppm 72 44 45 98

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: HUBORL [WUSCAR] 05931939 (Generated: 08/24/2023 16:54:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RAY BIRKO - HUBORL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EW180 320056\Diesel Engine [VCP412533] 17 Aug 2023 @ 3505.0 hrs

