
[[134055]] VOLVO A45G 352245 - BRAKE

Sample No: VCP418735
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 134055

LATTIMORE MATERIALS/HOLCIM - ROSSER - LAFARGE14242 S SH-34SCURRY, TXUS  75158Contact: WALLACE WARRENwallace.warren@lafargeholcim.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: LATSCUUnique No: 10617625Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 25 Aug 2023
Report Id: LATSCU [WUSCAR] 05932354 (Generated: 08/25/2023 10:51:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WALLACE WARREN - LATSCU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP418735 VCP423862 VCP393296 VCP398082Sample Date 11 Aug 2023 19 Jun 2023 03 Mar 2023 27 Dec 2022Machine Hours 9987 0 8955 8513Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 46.3 48.1 48.5 46.7
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 9 12 8 11Sodium ppm 2 0 0 <1Potassium ppm 0 2 2 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 15 18 13 17Copper ppm 95 114 86 119Lead ppm <1 0 <1 0Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 1 2 <1Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 2 4 3 3Nickel ppm 3 3 3 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2626 3396 2652 2533Magnesium ppm 9 11 8 8Zinc ppm 1250 1586 1206 1167Phosphorus ppm 1078 1334 1035 1028Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 34 34 27 39

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LATSCU [WUSCAR] 05932354 (Generated: 08/25/2023 10:51:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WALLACE WARREN - LATSCU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352245\Brake [VCP418735] 11 Aug 2023 @ 9987.0 hrs

