
VOLVO L150H 4487 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP401938
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILGARD 424
Job No:

SCHILDBERG CONSTRUCTION COMPANYPO BOX 358GREENFIELD, IAUS  50849Contact: SCOTT ARMSTRONGsarmstrong@schildberg.comT: (641)743-8237F: (641)743-2486
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SCHGREUnique No: 10617694Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 25 Aug 2023
Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 05932423 (Generated: 08/25/2023 11:54:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP401938 VCP378553 VCP363383 VCP362725Sample Date 15 Aug 2023 11 Apr 2023 07 Mar 2023 07 Nov 2022Machine Hours 17210 16479 16278 15641Oil Hours 731 838 637 1024Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 52.7 49.8 50.7 51.5
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 13 12 14 10Sodium ppm 3 3 4 3Potassium ppm 2 0 0 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 5 7 8Copper ppm <1 0 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 2 <1 1 0Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3645 3110 3606 3561Magnesium ppm 16 18 22 19Zinc ppm 1408 1250 1425 1427Phosphorus ppm 1177 953 1143 1123Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 140 106 122 111

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 05932423 (Generated: 08/25/2023 11:55:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 4487\Rear Axle [VCP401938] 15 Aug 2023 @ 17210.0 hrs

