
[[SWO-064854]] VOLVO A45G 352702 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP427492
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: SWO-064854

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10617706Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 25 Aug 2023
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05932435 (Generated: 08/25/2023 12:05:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP427492 VCP05853626 VCP393530 VCP391151Sample Date 15 Aug 2023 18 May 2023 20 Dec 2022 23 Sep 2022Machine Hours 3389 2923 2406 1971Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.3 28.7 28.8 29.4
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 8 6 5 13Sodium ppm 1 4 2 6Potassium ppm 3 3 2 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 28 15 9 24Copper ppm 26 14 9 27Lead ppm <1 0 0 <1Tin ppm 3 2 <1 2Aluminum ppm 9 5 3 8Chromium ppm 0 0 0 0Molybdenum ppm <1 0 <1 <1Nickel ppm 4 2 <1 3Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 1 <1 4Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 72 77 68 69Magnesium ppm 2 1 2 0Zinc ppm 5 0 2 0Phosphorus ppm 183 194 182 176Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 91 86 83 67

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05932435 (Generated: 08/25/2023 12:05:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352702\Transmission (Auto) [VCP427492] 15 Aug 2023 @ 3389.0 hrs

