
[[134053]] VOLVO A25G 740144 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP419439
Oil Type: TES SYN 295
Job No: 134053

FCS CONSTRUCTION LLCPO BOX 190829DALLAS, TXUS  75219Contact: SHANE WHITEWOODswhitewood@friscocs.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)TES SYN 295.  Please confirm. All component wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: FCSDALUnique No: 10617721Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 24 Aug 2023
Report Id: FCSDAL [WUSCAR] 05932450 (Generated: 08/24/2023 14:40:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SHANE WHITEWOOD - FCSDAL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP419439 VCP408785 VCP384069 VCP361992Sample Date 18 Aug 2023 02 May 2023 01 Nov 2022 01 Feb 2022Machine Hours 9495 8939 8552 7576Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 30.2 30.2 28.3 27.4
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 2 0 2 4Sodium ppm 0 2 0 8Potassium ppm 1 <1 2 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 8 16 25Copper ppm 4 2 9 24Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm <1 0 2 4Aluminum ppm 2 2 11 19Chromium ppm 0 0 0 0Molybdenum ppm <1 0 <1 1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 0 <1 1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 12 6 54 88Magnesium ppm 2 2 2 4Zinc ppm 31 19 39 36Phosphorus ppm 152 161 178 217Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 63 61 55 69

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: FCSDAL [WUSCAR] 05932450 (Generated: 08/24/2023 14:40:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SHANE WHITEWOOD - FCSDAL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 740144\Transmission (Auto) [VCP419439] 18 Aug 2023 @ 9495.0 hrs

