
[[A10915 RMR]] VOLVO L150F 14545 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP413718
Oil Type: MOBIL HYDRAULIC OIL AW 46
Job No: A10915 RMR

HOFFMAN EQUIPMENT - LIONVILLE120 GORDON DRIVELIONVILLE, PAUS  19341Contact: JIM FEHRjim.fehr@hoffmanequip.comT: (610)363-9200F: (610)594-0829
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. We were unable toperform a particle count due to ahigh concentration of particlespresent in this sample.All componentwear rates are normal. Moderateconcentration of visible dirt/debrispresent in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO8879Unique No: 10617995Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 25 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8879 [WUSCAR] 05932724 (Generated: 08/25/2023 17:25:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM FEHR - VOLVO8879

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413718 VCP363940 --- ---Sample Date 15 Aug 2023 01 Sep 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 25730 23486 --- ---Oil Hours 1000 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 47.5 43.8 --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.37 0.53 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm --- 21965 --- ---Particles >6µm --- 954 --- ---Particles >14µm --- 41 --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) --- 22/17/13 --- ---Silicon ppm <1 <1 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 0 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm <1 1 --- ---Copper ppm <1 <1 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 1 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 0 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 149 83 --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 5 --- ---Zinc ppm 449 597 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 363 464 --- ---Barium ppm 0 1 --- ---Boron ppm 0 <1 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8879 [WUSCAR] 05932724 (Generated: 08/25/2023 17:25:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM FEHR - VOLVO8879
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150F 14545\Hydraulic System [VCP413718] 15 Aug 2023 @ 25730.0 hrs

