
[[A10890]] VOLVO A35G 352057 - BOGIE/CENTER AXLE

Sample No: VCP414306
Oil Type: MOBIL GO 102
Job No: A10890

JAMES J ANDERSON6958 TORRESDALE AVENUEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19135Contact: JOHN HERBUTherb@jjaconstruction.comT: (215)850-9051F: (215)427-0208
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: JAAPHIUnique No: 10618282Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 25 Aug 2023
Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 05933011 (Generated: 08/25/2023 18:17:28) Rev: 1 Submitted By: ROBERT LOCKHOFF

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414306 VCP388808 VCB0000096 ---Sample Date 14 Aug 2023 06 Oct 2022 04 Mar 2022 ---Machine Hours 2020 1195 470 ---Oil Hours 1020 1195 470 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 52.0 49.6 50.1 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 2 4 5 ---Sodium ppm 1 4 5 ---Potassium ppm 0 3 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 75 133 198 ---Copper ppm <1 2 2 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm <1 0 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 1 <1 <1 ---Chromium ppm 1 2 3 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 3 5 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 2 6 9 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 7 14 59 ---Magnesium ppm 1 0 0 ---Zinc ppm 3 12 23 ---Phosphorus ppm 2624 2207 2440 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 311 237 255 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 05933011 (Generated: 08/25/2023 18:17:31) Rev: 1 Submitted By: ROBERT LOCKHOFF
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A35G 352057\Bogie/Center Axle [VCP414306] 14 Aug 2023 @ 2020.0 hrs

