
[[G07590]] VOLVO A40D 70043 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP435249
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: G07590

BLENHEIM CONSTRUCTION302 INDEPENDENCE BLVDSICKLERVILLE, NJUS  08081Contact: KEN LARDIklardi@blenheimconstruction.comT: (856)728-8880F: (856)728-8866
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Thecarboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: BLECAMUnique No: 10618321Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 28 Aug 2023
Report Id: BLECAM [WUSCAR] 05933050 (Generated: 08/28/2023 17:16:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEN LARDI - BLECAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435249 --- --- ---Sample Date 18 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 14731 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 8.08 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 49.8 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -33 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Red --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: BLECAM [WUSCAR] 05933050 (Generated: 08/28/2023 17:16:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEN LARDI - BLECAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40D 70043\Coolant [VCP435249] 18 Jul 2023 @ 14731.0 hrs

