
[[225089 JMK TACOMA]] VOLVO L90H 625422 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP426760
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40
Job No: 225089 JMK TACOMA

PACWEST MACHINERY8207 SOUTH 216TH STREETKENT, WAUS  98032Contact: T. GUSTINtgustin@pacwestmachinery.comT: (800)935-5933F: (509)534-5286
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal indicating ingress of sealmaterial. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO1271Unique No: 10618336Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 25 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO1271 [WUSCAR] 05933065 (Generated: 08/25/2023 16:10:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: T. GUSTIN - VOLVO1271

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP426760 --- --- ---Sample Date 14 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 11125 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 14.9 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.7 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 95 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.7 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 93 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 69 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 30 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 32 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 67 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 2 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1350 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1024 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1416 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1164 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 8 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1271 [WUSCAR] 05933065 (Generated: 08/25/2023 16:10:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: T. GUSTIN - VOLVO1271
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 625422\Diesel Engine [VCP426760] 14 Aug 2023 @ 11125.0 hrs

