
[[X58459]] VOLVO EC350EL 314368 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP406520
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: X58459

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Saint RosePO BOX 997SAINT ROSE, LAUS  70087Contact: DENISE CORVERSdcorvers@scottcompanies.comT: (504)461-0961F: (504)461-0970
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.The copper level isabnormal. In the absence of othersignificant wear metals, suspectcopper due to sources other thanwear (i.e. cooling core). Metal levelsare typical for a new componentbreaking in. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SCOSAIUnique No: 10618338Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 25 Aug 2023
Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 05933067 (Generated: 08/25/2023 16:13:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DENISE CORVERS - SCOSAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP406520 VCP367222 --- ---Sample Date 21 Aug 2023 28 Feb 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1476 617 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.9 9.9 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.3 5.3 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 91 68 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 0.1 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 82 83 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 64 59 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 1.1 --- ---Silicon ppm 10 27 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 4 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 12 --- ---Copper ppm 52 333 --- ---Lead ppm <1 1 --- ---Tin ppm 1 3 --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 4 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 50 93 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 1 4 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1872 2251 --- ---Magnesium ppm 462 58 --- ---Zinc ppm 1172 1214 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 902 1020 --- ---Barium ppm 2 0 --- ---Boron ppm 9 21 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 05933067 (Generated: 08/25/2023 16:13:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DENISE CORVERS - SCOSAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350EL 314368\Diesel Engine [VCP406520] 21 Aug 2023 @ 1476.0 hrs

