
[[225088 CEDAR GROVE]] VOLVO L180H 5422 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP424166
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 225088 CEDAR GROVE

PACWEST MACHINERY8207 SOUTH 216TH STREETKENT, WAUS  98032Contact: T. GUSTINtgustin@pacwestmachinery.comT: (800)935-5933F: (509)534-5286
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. The fluid wasnot specified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is SAE 10WAW Hydraulic Oil.  Please confirm theoil type and grade, and specify thebrand of the oil on your nextsample.All component wear rates arenormal. There is a moderate amountof silt (particulates < 14 microns insize) present in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. The oil is stillserviceable provided that thecontaminant(s) can be reduced toacceptable levels.

Depot: VOLVO1271Unique No: 10618743Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 28 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO1271 [WUSCAR] 05933472 (Generated: 08/28/2023 14:17:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: T. GUSTIN - VOLVO1271

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424166 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3060 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.8 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.36 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 16873 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 3349 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 245 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/19/15 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 2 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 51 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 430 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 334 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1271 [WUSCAR] 05933472 (Generated: 08/28/2023 14:17:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: T. GUSTIN - VOLVO1271
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 5422\Hydraulic System [VCP424166] 17 Aug 2023 @ 3060.0 hrs

