
[[SW1023101]] VOLVO L220H 3297 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP370754
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: SW1023101

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4323 EAST WINSLOW AVENUEPHOENIX, AZUS  85040Contact: RANDY PRZEKURATrandyp@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (602)414-1904
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. Check forlow coolant level. We advise that youcheck the air filter, air inductionsystem, and any areas where dirt mayenter the component. Werecommend that you drain the oiland perform a filter service on thiscomponent if not already done. Weadvise that you inspect for thesource(s) of wear. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Piston, ring and cylinderwear is indicated. High wear metallevels reflect the reported failure.Sodium and/or potassium levels arehigh. Elemental levels of silicon (Si)and aluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. The oilis no longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO6174Unique No: 10619892Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 29 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 05934621 (Generated: 08/29/2023 16:41:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP370754 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5418 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.7 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 13.7 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 73 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.5 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 75 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 80 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 2974 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 292 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 178 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1468 --- --- ---Copper ppm 21 --- --- ---Lead ppm 13 --- --- ---Tin ppm 10 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 951 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 37 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 54 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 9 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 116 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 22 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2584 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1178 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1013 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 883 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 40 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 05934621 (Generated: 08/29/2023 16:41:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 3297\Diesel Engine [VCP370754] 24 Aug 2023 @ 5418.0 hrs

