
[[581770 CENTRAL SITE]] VOLVO EC350 310468 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP417634
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 581770 CENTRAL SITE

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: JOHN FARDELLAJFARDELLA@ALTAEQUIPFL.COMT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10619899Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 29 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05934628 (Generated: 08/29/2023 08:55:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP417634 VCP385148 VCP344402 VCP310926Sample Date 03 Aug 2023 15 Nov 2022 22 Oct 2021 31 Mar 2021Machine Hours 7007 6545 5193 4577Oil Hours 500 500 1500 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.2 13.0 12.4 12.1Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.3 10.3 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 79 93 79 83
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 0.4 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 62 84 72 72Sulfation (PA) % 58 66 59 63Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 0.7 <1.0 0.7 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 7 6 6Sodium ppm 4 2 2 2Potassium ppm 0 2 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 13 5 5Copper ppm 2 5 5 4Lead ppm 0 <1 1 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 0 <1 1 0Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 60 40 54 41Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1712 1715 1673 1511Magnesium ppm 500 469 407 448Zinc ppm 1114 1084 1043 993Phosphorus ppm 904 910 894 875Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 38 18 31 29

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05934628 (Generated: 08/29/2023 08:55:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350 310468\Diesel Engine [VCP417634] 03 Aug 2023 @ 7007.0 hrs

