
[[593849]] VOLVO L150H 6057 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP416751
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 593849

PARAGON DEVELOPMENT GROUP402 N FRONTAGE RDPLANT CITY, FLUS  33563Contact: ED WALPOLEedwiv@pdgpc.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: PARPLAUnique No: 10620316Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 28 Aug 2023
Report Id: PARPLA [WUSCAR] 05935045 (Generated: 08/29/2023 11:26:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ED WALPOLE - PARPLA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416751 VCP393959 VCP389366 VCP332001Sample Date 10 Aug 2023 10 Mar 2023 18 Oct 2022 19 Dec 2021Machine Hours 11051 10046 9035 7055Oil Hours 3000 2000 500 2000Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.7 46.3 46.3 41.7
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 14 13 12 11Sodium ppm 9 8 7 6Potassium ppm 0 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 71 50 39 40Copper ppm 3 2 2 5Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 1 1 1 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 1 2 2 5Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 1 <1 1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3833 3703 3766 3812Magnesium ppm 19 24 22 24Zinc ppm 1544 1552 1496 1418Phosphorus ppm 1291 1264 1250 1231Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 143 134 130 123

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PARPLA [WUSCAR] 05935045 (Generated: 08/29/2023 11:26:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ED WALPOLE - PARPLA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 6057\Rear Axle [VCP416751] 10 Aug 2023 @ 11051.0 hrs

