
VOLVO EC480EL 314321 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP405268
Oil Type: CHEVRON URSA SUPER PLUS EC 15W40
Job No:

CITY OF WISCONSIN RAPIDS444 W GRAND AVEWISCONSON RAPIDS, WIUS  54495Contact: MARK MCAULEYmmcauley@wirapids.orgT: (715)421-8266F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor. No other corrective action isrecommended at this time.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Light fuel dilution occurring. Noother contaminants were detected inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: CITWISUnique No: 10620391Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 01 Sep 2023
Report Id: CITWIS [WUSCAR] 05935120 (Generated: 09/01/2023 13:05:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK MCAULEY - CITWIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP405268 VCP309693 VCP309686 VCP309956Sample Date 18 Aug 2023 21 Mar 2023 01 Jul 2022 29 Oct 2021Machine Hours 2609 2109 1511 995Oil Hours 500 0 516 495Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL ATTENTION ATTENTION ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.0 11.6 12.1 12.3Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 5.7 5.4 6.5 ---Oxidation (PA) % 60 61 64 65
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 61 63 62 61Sulfation (PA) % 59 62 63 62Glycol % 0.0 NEG NEG NEGFuel % 1.4 2.2 <1.0 0.7Silicon ppm 6 5 5 6Sodium ppm 2 3 3 2Potassium ppm 3 <1 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 6 6 5Copper ppm 2 4 18 84Lead ppm 2 <1 1 1Tin ppm 1 <1 1 2Aluminum ppm 2 2 2 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 86 88 84 82Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1516 1498 1486 1558Magnesium ppm 424 447 411 404Zinc ppm 1307 1337 1300 1213Phosphorus ppm 1047 1083 1047 1036Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 304 248 307 302

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CITWIS [WUSCAR] 05935120 (Generated: 09/01/2023 13:05:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK MCAULEY - CITWIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 314321\Diesel Engine [VCP405268] 18 Aug 2023 @ 2609.0 hrs

