
[[W02007469-2]] VOLVO EC350EL 310856 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP416138
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILUBE HD 85W140
Job No: W02007469-2

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO INC8450 QUARRY ROADMANASSAS, VAUS  20110Contact: MIKE MAYHUGHMMAYHUGH@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: (703)393-7344F: (703)393-7844
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. We advise that youinspect for the source(s) of wear. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. Elemental levels of silicon(Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.The oil is no longer serviceable dueto the presence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0002Unique No: 10620987Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 28 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 05935716 (Generated: 08/28/2023 19:47:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416138 VCP361928 VCP278228 ---Sample Date 23 Aug 2023 17 Mar 2022 13 Aug 2020 ---Machine Hours 3993 1998 418 ---Oil Hours 2000 500 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status SEVERE NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 177 272 178 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 2378 14 13 ---Sodium ppm 12 0 4 ---Potassium ppm 65 3 3 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5205 109 375 ---Copper ppm 11 <1 <1 ---Lead ppm 0 0 <1 ---Tin ppm 1 0 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 337 2 0 ---Chromium ppm 66 3 8 ---Molybdenum ppm 20 5 <1 ---Nickel ppm 5 0 <1 ---Titanium ppm 43 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm 39 1 6 ---Vanadium ppm 1 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 497 170 9 ---Magnesium ppm 154 49 3 ---Zinc ppm 312 99 11 ---Phosphorus ppm 1039 995 394 ---Barium ppm 0 0 4 ---Boron ppm 164 143 2 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 05935716 (Generated: 08/28/2023 19:47:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350EL 310856\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP416138] 23 Aug 2023 @ 3993.0 hrs

