
[[B50586 JOHN D. WEEK]] ELTEC J0103 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP424091
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40
Job No: B50586 JOHN D. WEEK

CHADWICK-BAROSS INC188 PERRY ROADBANGOR, MEUS  04401Contact: MIKE MORINmmorin@chadwick-baross.comT: (207)735-0856F: (207)941-0856
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40.  Pleaseconfirm. All component wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO0007Unique No: 10621108Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 28 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0007 [WUSCAR] 05935837 (Generated: 08/28/2023 15:40:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MORIN - VOLVO0007

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424091 VCP424142 --- ---Sample Date 22 Aug 2023 21 Aug 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd N/A --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.3 11.2 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.8 5.9 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 63 80 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0.8 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 50 88 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 54 61 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 2 5 --- ---Sodium ppm 1 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 5 5 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2 14 --- ---Copper ppm <1 <1 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2155 2023 --- ---Magnesium ppm 25 14 --- ---Zinc ppm 1182 1065 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1005 879 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 198 95 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0007 [WUSCAR] 05935837 (Generated: 08/28/2023 15:40:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MORIN - VOLVO0007
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ELTEC ELTEC J0103\Diesel Engine [VCP424091] 22 Aug 2023 @ .0 hrs

