
VOLVO L250H 61 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP423721
Oil Type: SHELL TELLUS S2 V 68
Job No:

J.M. HUBER10322 HWY 53 EMARBLE HILL, GAUS  30148Contact: GEORGE GIBSONgeorge.gibson@huber.comT: (770)893-7602F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The system cleanliness isacceptable for your target ISO 4406cleanliness code. The system andfluid cleanliness is acceptable. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.The condition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: JMHMARUnique No: 10621336Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 29 Aug 2023
Report Id: JMHMAR [WUSCAR] 05936065 (Generated: 08/29/2023 08:37:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GEORGE GIBSON - JMHMAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP423721 VCP319749 VCP249946 VCP191982Sample Date 16 Aug 2023 02 Dec 2021 11 Oct 2019 30 Mar 2018Machine Hours 16170 12087 0 4600Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL ATTENTION ATTENTION ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 59.3 51.1 53.8 51.1Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.28 0.284 0.284 0.398
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 3444 4217 1097 3533Particles >6µm 771 630 254 934Particles >14µm 23 36 13 149ISO 4406:1999 (c) 19/17/12 19/16/12 17/15/11 19/17/14Silicon ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Sodium ppm 0 1 2 2Potassium ppm <1 0 0 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm <1 2 6 5Copper ppm <1 <1 2 3Lead ppm <1 <1 1 1Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 0 0 <1 <1Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 2 <1 0 <1Nickel ppm <1 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm 0 0 0 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 69 74 80 95Magnesium ppm 58 6 4 2Zinc ppm 351 397 397 407Phosphorus ppm 278 342 303 325Barium ppm 1 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 4 2 3

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JMHMAR [WUSCAR] 05936065 (Generated: 08/29/2023 08:37:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GEORGE GIBSON - JMHMAR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L250H 61\Hydraulic System [VCP423721] 16 Aug 2023 @ 16170.0 hrs

