
[[594723]] VOLVO L60H 623021 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP416071
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No: 594723

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval tomonitor.Moderate concentration ofvisible metal present. All componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 10621731Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 29 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05936460 (Generated: 08/29/2023 13:02:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416071 VCP406255 VCP396470 ---Sample Date 21 Aug 2023 24 Apr 2023 30 Jan 2023 ---Machine Hours 1808 313 539 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 29.1 28.0 28.1 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 10 9 9 ---Sodium ppm 6 4 4 ---Potassium ppm <1 0 2 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 168 114 85 ---Copper ppm 9 8 8 ---Lead ppm 0 0 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 1 <1 <1 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 9 8 9 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 70 73 73 ---Magnesium ppm 0 2 1 ---Zinc ppm 25 31 22 ---Phosphorus ppm 189 176 200 ---Barium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Boron ppm 81 68 72 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05936460 (Generated: 08/29/2023 13:02:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60H 623021\Transmission (Auto) [VCP416071] 21 Aug 2023 @ 1808.0 hrs

