
[[SWA292727]] SENNEBOGEN 860 860.0.1095 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP410282
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: SWA292727

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: DAVE ENGDAVE.ENG@ALTG.COMT: (312)350-2560F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition. Please note that there wastoo much water present in the oil toperform an accurate viscositytest.Gear wear is indicated. Bearingand/or bushing wear is indicated.There is a high concentration ofwater present in the oil. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 10622870Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 05937599 (Generated: 08/30/2023 15:07:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP410282 --- --- ---Sample Date 25 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 10929 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 0.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 73.3 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 10 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1116 --- --- ---Copper ppm 298 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm 28 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 10 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 12 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 111 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 19 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 269 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 604 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 176 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 05937599 (Generated: 08/30/2023 15:07:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 860 860.0.1095\Swing Drive [VCP410282] 25 Aug 2023 @ 10929.0 hrs

