
[[X45015 WOMBLE]] VOLVO EC750EL 314232 - RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP418924
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: X45015 WOMBLE

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Memphis4515 PIDGEON ROOST ROADMEMPHIS, TNUS  38118Contact: PHLLIP SIMMONSpsimmons@scottcompanies.comT: (901)570-2113F: (901)346-8865
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.Metal levels are typical fora new component breaking in. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0123Unique No: 10630556Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 05 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0123 [WUSCAR] 05939944 (Generated: 09/05/2023 17:43:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PHLLIP SIMMONS - VOLVO0123

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP418924 --- --- ---Sample Date 25 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 682 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 173 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 48 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 510 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 9 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 6 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 7 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 15 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 7 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 298 --- --- ---Barium ppm 13 --- --- ---Boron ppm 1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0123 [WUSCAR] 05939944 (Generated: 09/05/2023 17:43:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PHLLIP SIMMONS - VOLVO0123
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC750EL 314232\Right Final Drive [VCP418924] 25 Aug 2023 @ 682.0 hrs

