
[[SPM595107]] VOLVO L90H 625106 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP354497
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: SPM595107

UNITED SCRAP1545 S CICERO AVECICERO, ILUS  60804Contact: RON LUCHTENBURGrluchten@unitedscrap.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: UNICICILUnique No: 10631624Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 06 Sep 2023
Report Id: UNICICIL [WUSCAR] 05941012 (Generated: 09/06/2023 12:22:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RON LUCHTENBURG - UNICICIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP354497 VCP391107 VCP377706 ---Sample Date 22 Aug 2023 27 Sep 2022 09 Jun 2022 ---Machine Hours 4106 2921 2330 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.8 42.8 39.7 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 50 12 12 ---Sodium ppm 3 <1 8 ---Potassium ppm 0 2 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 23 10 50 ---Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Lead ppm <1 0 0 ---Tin ppm 1 <1 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 2 2 1 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 3 ---Molybdenum ppm 2 <1 11 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 0 ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 2 1 8 ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4078 4087 3754 ---Magnesium ppm 27 14 10 ---Zinc ppm 1622 1704 1522 ---Phosphorus ppm 1273 1327 1257 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 162 136 138 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: UNICICIL [WUSCAR] 05941012 (Generated: 09/06/2023 12:22:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RON LUCHTENBURG - UNICICIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 625106\Front Axle [VCP354497] 22 Aug 2023 @ 4106.0 hrs

