
[[21]] VOLVO L90H 25852 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP366258
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 21

PLEASANT RIVER LUMBERPO BOX 68DOVER FOXCROFT, MEUS  04426Contact: NICK BUSHWAYnbushway@pleasantriverlumber.comT: (207)564-8520F: (207)564-8259
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: PLEDOVUnique No: 10632195Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 05 Sep 2023
Report Id: PLEDOV [WUSCAR] 05941583 (Generated: 09/05/2023 15:48:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NICK BUSHWAY - PLEDOV

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP366258 VCP325019 VCP356844 VCP328044Sample Date 02 Jun 2023 09 Dec 2022 11 Aug 2022 27 Jan 2022Machine Hours 9128 6782 4794 2481Oil Hours 2400 2000 2000 2481Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.2 42.5 42.2 40.1
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 15 13 10 15Sodium ppm 1 3 4 12Potassium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 52 57 35 70Copper ppm 4 47 10 82Lead ppm 0 1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 7 1 8Aluminum ppm 1 2 1 1Chromium ppm 1 1 <1 4Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 3Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 1 1 1 7Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4343 3910 3302 3653Magnesium ppm 23 17 13 14Zinc ppm 1678 1594 1474 1523Phosphorus ppm 1343 1342 1196 1236Barium ppm 0 0 <1 0Boron ppm 179 137 125 122

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PLEDOV [WUSCAR] 05941583 (Generated: 09/05/2023 15:48:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NICK BUSHWAY - PLEDOV
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 25852\Rear Axle [VCP366258] 02 Jun 2023 @ 9128.0 hrs

