
[[595382 FORT IRON]] VOLVO EC480 314276 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP435350
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 595382 FORT IRON

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PAUL CONZpaul.conz@altg.comT: (313)348-8861F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Oil and filterchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor this condition.Please note that there was too muchwater present in the oil to perform aviscosity test.All component wearrates are normal. Fuel contentnegligible. There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. The oil viscosity is lower thannormal. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 10632442Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 07 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 05941830 (Generated: 09/07/2023 14:46:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL CONZ - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435350 VCP392570 VCP365083 ---Sample Date 30 Aug 2023 27 Dec 2022 09 Aug 2022 ---Machine Hours 2932 2449 2006 ---Oil Hours 500 500 400 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status SEVERE ATTENTION NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.9 12.2 12.5 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.7 8.0 9.3 ---Oxidation (PA) % 61 57 66 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 1.62 --- --- ---Soot % % 0.1 0.2 0.1 ---Nitration (PA) % 76 73 75 ---Sulfation (PA) % 53 52 57 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % 3.9 0.8 <1.0 ---Silicon ppm 8 11 11 ---Sodium ppm 3 1 1 ---Potassium ppm <1 1 2 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 10 8 ---Copper ppm 2 2 5 ---Lead ppm 0 1 <1 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 1 ---Aluminum ppm 1 1 <1 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 61 51 51 ---Nickel ppm 2 2 1 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1157 1527 1280 ---Magnesium ppm 1005 879 761 ---Zinc ppm 1329 1353 1159 ---Phosphorus ppm 1078 1060 945 ---Barium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Boron ppm <1 2 7 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 05941830 (Generated: 09/07/2023 14:46:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL CONZ - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480 314276\Diesel Engine [VCP435350] 30 Aug 2023 @ 2932.0 hrs

