
[[SPM593813]] VOLVO L90E 28002 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP415255
Oil Type: VOLVO WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL
Job No: SPM593813

VICTORY AUTO WRECKERS710 EAST GREEN STREETBENSENVILLE, ILUS  60196Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (630)860-2000F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a lightconcentration of water present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VICBENUnique No: 10633247Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 07 Sep 2023
Report Id: VICBEN [WUSCAR] 05942635 (Generated: 09/07/2023 15:55:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - VICBEN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP415255 VCP377923 --- ---Sample Date 25 Aug 2023 24 May 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 22201 20455 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status MARGINAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.1 40.2 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.349 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 11 11 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 0 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 20 109 --- ---Copper ppm 1 <1 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 0 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 2 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 3 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3975 3939 --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 14 --- ---Zinc ppm 1602 1625 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1317 1290 --- ---Barium ppm 2 0 --- ---Boron ppm 154 121 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VICBEN [WUSCAR] 05942635 (Generated: 09/07/2023 15:55:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - VICBEN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90E 28002\Front Axle [VCP415255] 25 Aug 2023 @ 22201.0 hrs

