
[[SWO065411 SUNBELT]] DOOSAN C-185 496404UIAD087 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP388214
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: SWO065411 SUNBELT

COWIN EQUIPMENT - ATLANTA5710 RIVERVIEW RDMABLETON, GAUS  30126Contact: MIKE ANDREWSmandrews@cowin.comT: (404)690-7210F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thesystem. There is no indication of anycontamination in the fuel. Thecondition of the fuel is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: COWMABUnique No: 10633361Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 21 Sep 2023
Report Id: COWMAB [WUSCAR] 05942749 (Generated: 09/22/2023 06:55:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE ANDREWS - COWMAB

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP388214 --- --- ---Sample Date 30 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1469 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.46 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.004 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COWMAB [WUSCAR] 05942749 (Generated: 09/22/2023 06:55:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE ANDREWS - COWMAB
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	DOOSAN DOOSAN C-185 496404UIAD087\Diesel Fuel [VCP388214] 30 Aug 2023 @ 1469.0 hrs

