
[[SWA341088]] VOLVO L150G 22536 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP432740
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: SWA341088

MR BULTS INCSULLIVAN COUNTY LANDFILLMONTICELLO, NYUS  12701Contact: 
T: (208)324-7148F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. There is no indicationof any contamination in the coolant.The glycol level is high. Carboxylatetest failed. The pH level of this fluid iswithin the acceptable limits.

Depot: MRBMONNYUnique No: 10633423Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 08 Sep 2023
Report Id: MRBMONNY [WUSCAR] 05942811 (Generated: 09/08/2023 10:04:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - MRBMONNY

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP432740 --- --- ---Sample Date 26 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 16482 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.68 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 69.7 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -66 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Orange --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: MRBMONNY [WUSCAR] 05942811 (Generated: 09/08/2023 10:04:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - MRBMONNY
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150G 22536\Coolant [VCP432740] 26 Aug 2023 @ 16482.0 hrs

