
VOLVO A25G 740250 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP412167
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5151 DR MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVDFORT MYERS, FLUS  33905Contact: TODD LARKtlark@altaequipfl.comT: F: (239)481-3302
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of oil entry. We recommenddrain/flush system, and refill with50/50 antifreeze water mixture. Oilpresent. Carboxylate test failed. Theglycol level is acceptable. The pHlevel of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VOLVO0090Unique No: 10633425Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 08 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05942813 (Generated: 09/08/2023 10:30:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412167 --- --- ---Sample Date 28 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5525 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 8.13 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 40.0 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -13 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance oil --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05942813 (Generated: 09/08/2023 10:30:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 740250\Coolant [VCP412167] 28 Aug 2023 @ 5525.0 hrs

