
VOLVO A40G 352026 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP402955
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No:

SCHILDBERG CONSTRUCTION COMPANYPO BOX 358GREENFIELD, IAUS  50849Contact: SCOTT ARMSTRONGsarmstrong@schildberg.comT: (641)743-8237F: (641)743-2486
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: SCHGREUnique No: 10633958Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 07 Sep 2023
Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 05943346 (Generated: 09/08/2023 14:42:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP402955 VCP400068 VCP384383 VCP404866Sample Date 29 Aug 2023 19 Jul 2023 07 Jun 2023 02 May 2023Machine Hours 9029 8711 8529 8289Oil Hours 318 182 240 308Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 12.6 12.7 12.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.0 10.2 10.1 8.6Oxidation (PA) % 81 80 73 73
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.3 0.1Nitration (PA) % 55 50 51 51Sulfation (PA) % 61 60 59 54Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 0.4 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 2 4 4Sodium ppm 4 1 6 11Potassium ppm 1 3 2 6
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 3 4 4Copper ppm 0 <1 2 0Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 0Tin ppm <1 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 1 <1 <1 3Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 0Molybdenum ppm 37 42 39 41Nickel ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1637 1646 1588 1795Magnesium ppm 514 470 473 539Zinc ppm 855 865 883 910Phosphorus ppm 717 760 733 803Barium ppm 2 2 0 0Boron ppm 48 62 56 52

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 05943346 (Generated: 09/08/2023 14:42:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352026\Diesel Engine [VCP402955] 29 Aug 2023 @ 9029.0 hrs

