
VOLVO A40G 352724 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP370289
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER GEAR OIL 75W-80-GO102
Job No:

216 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - PIEDMONT407 OAK ROADPIEDMONT, SCUS  29673Contact: DRAISEN CAREYdraisen.carey@ascendummachinery.comT: (864)704-1060F: (864)704-1069
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Gear wear is indicated.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal indicating ingress of sealmaterial. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO4596Unique No: 10634478Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 08 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO4596 [WUSCAR] 05943866 (Generated: 10/24/2023 11:12:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DRAISEN CAREY - VOLVO4596

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP370289 VCP370291 VCE084219 ---Sample Date 29 Aug 2023 29 Aug 2023 01 Dec 2022 ---Machine Hours 3195 3195 2139 ---Oil Hours 1000 1000 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 46.1 98.0 45.9 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 54 24 61 ---Sodium ppm 9 2 11 ---Potassium ppm 4 2 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 451 31 102 ---Copper ppm 7 14 5 ---Lead ppm 0 0 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 2 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 0 23 <1 ---Chromium ppm 4 4 1 ---Molybdenum ppm 11 <1 7 ---Nickel ppm 3 6 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 8 3 4 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 86 2155 63 ---Magnesium ppm 7 67 6 ---Zinc ppm 122 990 108 ---Phosphorus ppm 2044 833 2093 ---Barium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Boron ppm 127 2 112 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4596 [WUSCAR] 05943866 (Generated: 10/24/2023 11:12:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DRAISEN CAREY - VOLVO4596
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352724\Drop Box [VCP370289] 29 Aug 2023 @ 3195.0 hrs

